

BID DOCUMENT

<u>ITEM</u>	<u>QUANTITY</u>	<u>PRICE</u>
1. Cleaner/Deodorizer	100 Gal.	<u>3.60</u> /Gal.
2. Brooms	72 Each	<u>NO BID</u> /Each
3. Mop compound	100 Gal.	<u>3.97</u> /Gal.
4. Tile Floor Wax	300 Gal.	<u>9.75</u> /Gal.
5. Garden Sprayer	12 Each	<u>NO BID</u> /Each
6. Glass Cleaner	100 Gal.	<u>6.70</u> /Gal.
7. Liquid Hand Cleaner	150 Gal.	<u>NO BID</u> /Gal.
8. Cleaner Disinfectant	100 Gal.	<u>4.90</u> /Gal.
9. Bathroom Cleaner	5000 Qts.	<u>1.28</u> /Qts.
10. Standard Strength Stripper	60 Gal.	<u>6.00</u> /Gal.
11. Rubber Gloves (Medium)	100 Pair	<u>NO BID</u> Pair
(Large)	200 Pair	<u>NO BID</u> Pair
12. Spray Heads	150 Each	<u>NO BID</u> /Each
13. Spay Maintainer	100 Gal.	<u>4.50</u> /Gal.
14. Urinal Screens	200 each	<u>NO BID</u> /Each
15. Scrub Pads	100 Each	<u>.24</u> /Each
16. Screen Disc 20"	20 each	<u>4.50</u> /Each



2078B Hollywood Drive
Jackson, TN 38305

BID DOCUMENT

<u>ITEM</u>	<u>QUANTITY</u>	<u>ITEM</u>
17. Shop Towels	20 Cases	<u>28.75</u> /Cases
18. Disposable Gloves	40 cases	<u>44.00</u> /case
19. Feather Dusters	48 Each	<u>NO BID</u> /Each
20. Wet Mop w/Stick	48 Each	<u>2.85</u> /Each #16
21. Wet Mop Frame w/Handle	48 Each	<u>6.00</u> /Each
22. Lambs Wool Pads	24 Each	<u>2.25</u> /Each
23. Dust Mop Handles	24 Each	<u>5.25</u> /Each
24. Gym Floor Finish	75 Gal.	<u>27.30</u> Gal.
25. Cleaner/Degreaser	50 Gal.	<u>4.00</u> Gal.
26. Mop Buckets w/Wringer	6 Each	<u>69.00</u> Each
27. Floor Polish	40 Gal.	<u>8.75</u> Gal.
28. Dust Mop Heads	(24") 24 Each	<u>3.90</u> /Each
	(36") 24 Each	<u>6.00</u> /Each
	(48") 24 Each	<u>9.65</u> /Each
	(72") 24 Each	<u>29.66</u> /Each
29. Trash can liners (16x14x36)	300 cases	<u>30.65</u> Case
	(22x14x58) 250 cases	<u>23.75</u> Case
30. Toilet tissue	150 cases	<u>31.00</u> Case 2ply 500sh: 961CS
31. Floor pads		
	20 inch natural hair 10 cases	<u>16.00</u> Case
	20 inch white 50 cases	<u>16.00</u> Case
	20 inch black 10 cases	<u>16.00</u> Case



2078B Hollywood Drive
Jackson, TN 38305

20 inch green

10 cases

16.00/Case

32. Carpet bonnets	18 each	<u>14.75</u> /Each
33. Dust Mop Frames (24")	6 each	<u>2.60</u> /Each
Dust Mop Frames (36")	6 each	<u>3.25</u> /Each
Dust Mop Frames (48")	6 each	<u>4.65</u> /Each
34. Janitor's cart	4 each	<u>140.00</u> /Each
35. Terrazzo Floor Finish	30 gal.	<u>27.11</u> /Gal.
36. Dustpans	20 each	<u>2.60</u> /Each
37. Disinfectant Wipes	3000 each	<u>34.32</u> /Each <i>CS/450/c</i>
38. Facial Tissue	3000 boxes	<u>.57</u> /Box
39. Absorbent	20 cases	<u>no bid</u> case
40. Bleach	10 cases	<u>9.75</u> /case
41. Laundry Detergent	10 each	<u>no bid</u> Each

NOTE: All amounts are approximate. More or less of any item may be purchased.



2078B Hollywood Drive
Jackson, TN 38305